
Supplier Vendor Number: 1119

Delivery Cost $79.00/hr

Minimum Tons 18 tons Bid Number: 6234

Contract Period:

Location Bedford Location W. 3rd Location W. 150th Location Copley

Contact 216-232-3080 216-861-5100 216-265-8990 330-666-2466

Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit 

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.70 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.10 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.70 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.00 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  46.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  62.20 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.00 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  48.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  71.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  69.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  71.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  68.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  58.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt W/ Recycled 

Asphalt Product 

(RAP)

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  58.25 

Per Ton

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

Allied - The Shelly Co.

January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

Contract Number: 20170005



Supplier Vendor Number: 6945

Delivery Cost NA

Minimum Tons NA Bid Number: 6234

Contract Period:

Location Columbia Station Location Garfield Hts. Location Cleveland

Item Description Cost

Unit 

Item Description Cost

Unit 

Item Description Cost

Unit 

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  60.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  60.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  60.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  70.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  69.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  69.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  65.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt W/ Recycled 

Asphalt Product 

(RAP)

 $  64.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  64.50 

Per Ton

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

5 Gallon Tack 

Coat Buckets 

(excluding tack)

 No Bid 

Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 No Bid 

Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 No Bid 

Each

Kokosing Materials, Inc

January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

Contract Number: 20170006



Supplier Vendor Number: 1119

Delivery Cost $79.00/hr

Minimum Tons 18 tons Bid Number: 6234

Contract Period:

Location Bedford Location W. 3rd Location W. 150th Location Copley

Contact 216-232-3080 216-861-5100 216-265-8990 330-666-2466

Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit 

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.70 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.10 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.70 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.00 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  46.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  62.20 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.00 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  48.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  71.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  69.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  71.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  68.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  58.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt W/ Recycled 

Asphalt Product 

(RAP)

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  58.25 

Per Ton

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

Allied - The Shelly Co.

January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

Contract Number: 20170005



Supplier Vendor Number: 6945

Delivery Cost NA

Minimum Tons NA Bid Number: 6234

Contract Period:

Location Columbia Station Location Garfield Hts. Location Cleveland

Item Description Cost

Unit 

Item Description Cost

Unit 

Item Description Cost

Unit 

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  60.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  60.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  60.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  70.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  69.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  69.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  65.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt W/ Recycled 

Asphalt Product 

(RAP)

 $  64.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  64.50 

Per Ton

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

5 Gallon Tack 

Coat Buckets 

(excluding tack)

 No Bid 

Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 No Bid 

Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 No Bid 

Each

Kokosing Materials, Inc

January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

Contract Number: 20170006



Supplier Vendor Number: 1119

Delivery Cost $79.00/hr

Minimum Tons 18 tons Bid Number: 6234

Contract Period:

Location Bedford Location W. 3rd Location W. 150th Location Copley

Contact 216-232-3080 216-861-5100 216-265-8990 330-666-2466

Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit Item Description Cost Unit 

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.70 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.10 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  63.70 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.00 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  49.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  46.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  64.25 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  62.20 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.00 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  50.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  48.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  71.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  69.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  71.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  68.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  58.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt W/ Recycled 

Asphalt Product 

(RAP)

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  58.25 

Per Ton

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 $    6.25 

Per Gallon

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 Included 

in above 

price Each

Allied - The Shelly Co.

January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

Contract Number: 20170005



Supplier Vendor Number: 6945

Delivery Cost NA

Minimum Tons NA Bid Number: 6234

Contract Period:

Location Columbia Station Location Garfield Hts. Location Cleveland

Item Description Cost

Unit 

Item Description Cost

Unit 

Item Description Cost

Unit 

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  59.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.75 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.50 

Per Ton

301 Asphalt With 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  54.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  60.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  60.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  60.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.75 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.50 

Per Ton

448-2 Intermediate 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  55.75 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  70.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt Virgin 

Materials

 $  69.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt 

Virgin Materials

 $  69.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  65.00 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface Course 

Asphalt W/ Recycled 

Asphalt Product 

(RAP)

 $  64.50 

Per Ton

448-1 Surface 

Course Asphalt W/ 

Recycled Asphalt 

Product (RAP)

 $  64.50 

Per Ton

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

407 Tack Coat Type 

SS1

 No Bid 

Per Gallon

5 Gallon Tack 

Coat Buckets 

(excluding tack)

 No Bid 

Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 No Bid 

Each

5 Gallon Tack Coat 

Buckets (excluding 

tack)

 No Bid 

Each

Kokosing Materials, Inc

January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

Contract Number: 20170006


